
Martin said he has seen 
the formulas the state uses 
to determine dollar amounts 
“was not feasible,” which 
is the reason the conver-
sation on other options for 
housing juveniles arose ear-
lier this year. He said he is 
concerned county taxpay-
ers “have to pay $134,000” 

until 2027. 
“Yeah, because we didn’t 

get that contract terminated 
before July 1,” Milburn-Kee 
said. 

“Which would have 
pushed it onto the next 
year,” Beerbower said. 

“I would love to have 
reviewed that contract soon-
er,” Milburn-Kee said. 

Martin said although the 
matter is a “done deal,” a 
complaint should be filed 
by the county counselor that 

the county cannot meet that 
cost “due to county finan-
cial hardships.” 

“That letter should have 
been filed. It should have 
been sent,” he said. “If they 
came back with something 
else, to me, I would have 
said take me to court and 
say OK, due to the finan-
cial hardships of Bourbon 
County, we cannot afford 
$134,000.” 

Martin said the three 
commissioners and previ-

ous commissioners have 
said “we are hurting right 
now.” 

“And now we’re seeing 
$134,000,” he said. “There 
are contracts broken every 
day through the courts at the 
local, state and national lev-
els. Why not challenge it?”

“I’m not saying we’re not 
going to,” Beerbower said. 

Beerbower said commis-
sioners have asked John-
son to determine where the 
county stands within its cur-
rent contract. 

“My next step was to 
reach out to the Department 
of Corrections,” Beerbower 
said. 

“There’s statutes and 
there’s contracts,” Mar-
tin said. “Don’t get the 
two mixed together. Let’s 
address the contract part of 
it.” 

Later, Martin asked if 
commissioners plan to chal-
lenge the matter with the 
contract with the Girard 
center.

“That’s kind of the con-
sensus,” Beerbower said. 

Milburn-Kee asked Mar-
tin if he would contact John-
son County about correcting 
their contract to state “no 
more than” based on figures 
that were discussed. Martin 
said he would reach out. 

“We don’t want to pay 
them more per day than 
what we think we’re going 
to pay them,” she said. 

County Clerk Susan 
Walker said she would try 
to find the state statute con-
cerning cancelling contracts 
due to “financial hardship.” 
Beerbower asked Walker to 
forward that statute to com-
missioners and Johnson. 

There was brief discus-
sion on potentially investing 
more money in CDs. 

“We could invest more,” 
Walker said. “We have 
more. We could sit on those 
tax dollars for awhile … as 
we’re receiving them, we 
could be investing those tax 
dollars.” 

Tran brought up the age 
of the contract with the cen-
ter in Girard, which was 
signed Nov. 1, 1992. He 
said that contract is an 
“insurance policy” for the 
county. 

“We’re paying $134,000 
to an NGO that promises to 
house juveniles, and that’s 
great, but we don’t use 
$134,000 worth of services 
according to the sheriff,” he 
said. “If we’re going to pay 
insurance policies … and 
we’re banking other things, 
if we’re going to bank, let’s 
bank. Let’s earmark certain 
dollar amounts and throw 
them into a CD. The point 
is, if we’re going to bank 
money, let’s bank money 
the right way. And in the 
future, instead of paying 
something like this, let’s 
take a look at the cost in 
totality and do a risk assess-
ment. That’s what this is 
about, a risk assessment.” 

Milburn-Kee said com-
missioners have been 
informed on the number of 
juveniles housed each year 
and a risk assessment has 
been done. 

“They said Johnson 
County is the way to go,” 
she said. 

“The topic has been 
breached by previous com-
missions and why we con-
tinue down the path we’ve 

been on, paying this kind of 
money,” Tran said. “Even 
before they raised it in 
2025, it was still way more 
than we ever took juveniles 
to there.”

Beerbower said commis-
sioners need to speak with 
the budget advisory com-
mittee as the matter moves 
forward. 

In June, Mike Walden, 
director for the SEK Region-
al Juvenile Detention Center 
and other administrators at 
the facility appeared before 
the commission. Walden 
talked about the history and 
operations of the facility, 
the center’s interlocal agree-
ment with Bourbon County 
signed in 1992 and laws 
concerning placement of 
juveniles.

The commission took no 
action following a discus-
sion on the juvenile deten-
tion budget. 

Also that month, com-
missioners talked with 
Martin, Undersheriff Kevin 
Davidson and Angie Eads, 
director of the Sixth Judicial 
District Community Correc-
tions regarding a potential 
to save money through a 
change in the provider for 
juvenile detention services.

Martin said he would like 
commissioners to consider 
changing from an annual 
contract with the Southeast 
Kansas Regional Juvenile 
Detention Center in Girard 
to a “pay as you go” agree-
ment with facilities in either 
Johnson County or Doug-
las County. Davidson said 
Johnson and Douglas coun-
ties offer similar per-day 
rates and services. 
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The Gordon Parks Muse-
um announces the installa-
tion of informational dis-
play signs and a welcome 
sign at the Wayman Chapel 
African Methodist Episco-
pal (AME) Church Com-
memorative Park, located 
at 301 S. Lowman Street in 
Fort Scott. Installation took 
place Tuesday, July 29.

This historic site, once 
home to the oldest Black 
church in Fort Scott. The 
property land of the Way-
man Chapel AME Church 
was donated to the Gor-
don Parks Museum by Fort 
Scott resident Josh Jones 
through the Fort Scott 
Community College Foun-
dation. The church was 

regularly attended by Gor-
don Parks and his family 
and was featured in a scene 
from Parks’ acclaimed film, 
“The Learning Tree.”

The property has been 
transformed into a com-
memorative, low-main-
tenance park honoring 
the legacy of the church. 
The new display signage 
includes four large story-
board panels (76” x 27”) 
featuring photos, graphics, 
and text that highlight the 
church’s rich history and its 
vital role in the local Black 
community. The panels 
were installed on a concrete 
slab beneath an already 
completed pergola structure 
(12’ x 20’). In addition, a 
large 4’ x 3’ welcome sign 
will greet visitors at the 
park entrance.

“We are very excited 
about this park, which pays 
tribute to the historic Way-
man Chapel AME Church, 
established in 1866 by the 
grandparents of Professor 
E. J. Hawkins,” said Gor-
don Parks Museum Exec-
utive Director Kirk Sharp. 
“We are incredibly grate-
ful to all of the sponsors 
who helped make this com-
memorative park a reality, 
especially Josh Jones and 
the Foundation. This park 
ensures that this important 
chapter of Fort Scott’s his-
tory continues to be hon-
ored and shared. It also sits 
along our ‘Learning Tree’ 
Film Sign Trail, adding 
even more depth to its sig-
nificance.”
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A 20 percent chance of 
showers and thunder-
storms after 1 p.m. Sunny 
and hot, with a high near 
96. Heat index values as 
high as 105. 

INSIDE:

The city’s annual flushing program and free 
chlorine burnout of the water distribution 
system is explained on page 5.

INSIDE:

Fort Scott was awarded funds through the 
Kansas Department of Transportation’s City 
Connecting Link Improvement Program. 
See page 5. 

INSIDE:

A local church host-
ed its second annual 
Backpack Giveaway 
for children.
See page 4. 

By Jason E.
Silvers

The Fort Scott Tribune

Plans are in the works 
to address safety concerns 
within the Bourbon County 
Public Works department. 

On Monday, Bourbon 
County Commissioners 
heard from representatives 
of the Kansas Workers Risk 
Cooperative for Counties 
(KWORCC) about its ser-
vices and discussed forma-
tion of a safety committee 
and other safety measures. 

Speaking to commission-
ers were Brandon Mann, 
senior vice president for 
loss prevention and edu-
cation for KWORCC, and 
Monte Parrish, loss preven-
tion safety consultant. Mann 
said Parrish is assigned to a 
territory that includes Bour-
bon County. Mann said he 
has worked with counties 
since 2001.

Mann said he understands 
there have been concerns 
with staffing and “potential-
ly” some safety issues at the 
road and bridge department. 
He asked commissioners 
what they hope to accom-
plish and how KWORCC 
can assist them in a plan. 

Commissioner Mika Mil-
burn-Kee said when com-
missioners were looking for 
an auditor who could help 
the commission in mak-
ing a plan, County Clerk 
Susan Walker presented 
KWORCC as an option.

As the commission liai-
son for public works, Com-
missioner Sam Tran said he 
has spent hours with staff 
in the department and said 
the goal is to “create and 
promote an environment of 
safety.” He said there have 

been numerous accidents 
within the department. 

“The issue we’re having 
here, I want to make sure 
there’s a culture of safety 
and a culture of account-
ability,” Tran said. “There 
seems to be too many acci-
dents happening out there. 
A lot of equipment is get-
ting damaged. Somebody 
got hurt.” 

Train said he would like 
to eventually build a safety 
program and see an audit of 
processes at public works to 
ensure “best practices” are 
being followed. He said the 
program would need “buy-
in” from employees, who 
would need to be account-
able for their work.

“We can build a pro-
gram, but if we can’t get 
the buy-in of employees, 
that program is not worth 
the paper it’s printed on,” 

he said. 
Tran said as commis-

sioners work on issues, he 
would prefer not to wait 
until Public Works Director 
Eric Bailey’s replacement is 
found, but rather have a pro-
gram already in place. Mil-
burn-Kee said KWORCC 
can help Bailey set up a 
program for Bailey’s suc-
cessor. 

Mann said he would help 
lead an effort to set up a 
program, and there should 
be a discussion involving 
the supervisors and a reso-
lution passed by the com-
mission in support of the 
safety program. He said a 
primary goal when find-
ing a public works director 
should be finding someone 
who is “safety minded.” 

“The number one goal 
for employees is to go home 
safe at the end of the day,” 
he said. 

“I think that’s every-
body’s goal,” Milburn-Kee 
said. 

“It sounds like from what 
I’ve heard that’s not every-
body’s goal,” Mann said. 
“It’s to get everything done 
as fast as they can despite 
safety.” 

“I would venture to guess 
you might be correct in your 
assertion,” Tran said. 

It was agreed Mann and 
Parrish would participate 
with Tran in an initial walk-
through of public works 
next week and commission-
ers tabled a work session 
until that is complete. Mann 
and Parrish will also receive 
copies of the manual and 
policies and procedures for 
public works and return 
later for a more detailed 
discussion.

By Jason E.
Silvers

The Fort Scott Tribune

A former Fort Scott 
Community College student 
and athlete killed in an offi-
cer-involved shooting Sat-
urday in Wyandotte County 
is remembered by friends, 
college leaders and former 
colleagues for his impact 
on athletics and the com-
munities where he lived and 
served.

Elijah Ming, who had 
most recently served for 
about nine years as a deputy 
for the Wyandotte Coun-
ty Sheriff’s Office, died of 
injuries sustained in a Satur-
day shooting, which is cur-
rently under investigation 
by the KBI, a news release 
issued Saturday states. 

Ming attended FSCC in 
the late 2000s. 

According to the release, 
KBI assistance was request-
ed about 5:05 p.m. Saturday. 
KBI agents and the Crime 
Scene Response Team 
responded to the scene. 

“Just before 3:30 p.m., 
a female subject called 
requesting that police 
accompany her as she 
moved out of a residence, 
due to concerns about her 
safety,” the release states. 
“She reported that when 
friends tried to assist her, 
a male subject threatened 
them with a firearm. At 
around 3:45 p.m., a deputy 
from the Wyandotte County 
Sheriff’s Office and an offi-
cer from the Kansas City, 
Kansas Police Department 
(KCKPD) arrived at the res-
idence at 2627 S. 30th St.

Tammy Helm/Tribune photo
Karl Miller, president and CEO of Lark Signs in Wichita, carries a post for 

one of the signs that were being set at the Wayman Chapel AME site Tuesday. 
Each sign will tell the history of Wayman Chapel, which was on the corner 
of 3rd and Lowman streets before it was condemned in 2001 and later razed.

Signs tell the story of the Wayman Chapel AME Church

Submitted photo 
Elijah Ming, right, of Kansas City, Kan., is pic-

tured with Jordan Lepoglow of Girard as the 2010 
fall homecoming king and queen at Fort Scott 
Community College. Ming was nominated by the 
FSCC baseball team and Lepoglow, the FSCC cos-
metology program.

Former FSCC athlete 
killed in line of duty

SEE MING ON PAGE 8

Jason E. Silvers/Tribune photo 
Bourbon County Commissioner Sam Tran, left, speaks to Brandon Mann 

and Monte Parrish with the Kansas Workers Risk Cooperative for Counties 
during a discussion Monday on a safety audit for public works.

SEE PUBLIC WORKS 
SAFETY ON PAGE 8

SEE WAYMAN CHAPEL 
ON PAGE 2

Focus turns to public works safety issues


