
Public Notice

(First Published in the
High Plains Daily
Leader & Times,
Liberal Kansas
June 17, 2025)t3

INTHEDISTRICT
COURTOFSEWARD
COUNTY,KANSAS

IN THE MATTER OF
THEESTATEOF
IGNACIO ROCHA
FRANCO,
deceased.

CASE NO. SW-2023-
PR-000023

NOTICEOFHEAR-
INGONPETITION
FORFINALSETTLE-

MENT
THE STATE OF
KANSASTOALLPER-
SONSCONCERNED:
You are hereby notified
that a Petition has been
filed in said Court by
MariaAguilarandPatricia
Talley, Co-Administrators
of the estate of Ignacio
Rocha Franco, deceased,
praying for a final settle-
ment of the estate,
approval of their acts, pro-
ceedings and accounts as
Co-Administrators,
approval of demands and
expenses, allowance for
attorneys' fees and
expenses, determination
of the heirs entitled to the
estate and assignment to
them in accordance with
the laws of the State of
Kansas. You are hereby
required to file your writ-
ten defenses thereto on or
before July 17, 2025 at
9:00 o'clock a.m., of said
day, in said Court, in the
City of Liberal, in Seward
County, Kansas at which
time and place said cause
will be heard. Should you
fail therein, judgment and
decree will be entered in
due course upon said
Petition.

MariaAguilar, Petitioner
Patricia Talley, Petitioner

Nathanial C. Foreman, #
22691
Tate, Kitzke & Foreman,
LLC
1024 S. Trindle
POBox 909
Hugoton, Kansas 67951
(620) 544-2103
Attorneys for Petitioners

(First published in the
High Plains Daily
Leader & Times,
Liberal, Kansas, on
June 10, 2025)t3

IN THE 26th JUDI-
CIAL DISTRICT

COURT OF SEWARD
COUNTY, KANSAS

In the Matter of the

Petition of
Maddyson Lena
Schwindt
Petitioner

to Change His/Her
Name to: Maddyson
Lena Pierce

Case No. SW-25-PT-61

Pursuant To K.S.A.
Chapter 60

NOTICE OF HEAR-
ING

- PUBLICATION

You are hereby notified
that Maddyson Lena
Schwindtt [Petitioner’s
Full Name], filed a
Petition in the above
court on the day of ,
requesting a judgment
and order changing
His/Her name from
Maddyson
Lena Schwindt to
Maddyson Lena Pierce

The Petition will be heard
in Seward, County
District Court, 415 N.
Washington Ste. 103,
Liberal Kansas, on the
18th day of July, 2025, at
9:00 a.m.

If you have any objection
to the requested name
change, you are required
to file a responsive plead-
ing on or before in this
court or appear at the
hearing and object to the
requested name change.
If you fail to act, judge-
ment an order will be
entered upon the Petition
as requested by the
Petitioner.

Judge of the District
Court

Maddyson Lena
Schwindt
Petitioner, Pro Se

(First Published in the
High Plains Daily

Leader & Times,
Liberal Kansas
June 3, 2025)t3

INTHEDISTRICT
COURTOFSEWARD
COUNTY,KANSAS
CIVILDEPART-

MENT

LakeviewLoan
Servicing, LLC
Plaintiff,

vs.

Micaela Rodriguez;
Unknown Spouse, if any,
ofMicaela Rodriguez;
JohnDoe
(Tenant/Occupant);Mary
Doe (Tenant/Occupant)
Defendants.

Case No. SW-2024-CV-
000104

Court Number:
Pursuant to K.S.A.

Chapter 60
NoticeOf Sale

Under and by virtue of an
Order of Sale issued to
me by the Clerk of the
District Court of Seward
County, Kansas, the
undersigned Sheriff of
Seward County, Kansas,
will offer for sale at pub-
lic auction and sell to the
highest bidder for cash in
hand, at the Front Door
of the Courthouse at
Liberal Seward County,
Kansas, on July 15, 2025,
at 10:00AM, the follow-
ing real estate:

Surface and surface
rights only, in and to:
LotOne (1), BlockOne
(1), Ralph'sAddition to
theCity of Liberal,
SewardCounty,
Kansas, according to
the recorded Plat there-

of, commonly known as
602 SVirginiaAve,
Liberal, KS 67901 (the
“Property”)
to satisfy the judgment in
the above-entitled case.
The sale is to bemade
without appraisement and
subject to the redemption
period as provided by
law, and further subject to
the approval of the Court.
Formore information,
visit www.Southlaw.com
GeneWard, Sheriff
Seward County, Kansas
Prepared By:
SouthLaw, P.C.
Blair T. Gisi (KS
#24096)
13160 Foster,, Suite 100
Overland Park, KS
66213-2660
(913) 663-7600
(913) 663-7899 (Fax)
Attorneys for Plaintiff
(249015)

(First Published in the
High Plains Daily
Leader & Times,
Liberal Kansas
June 3, 2025)t3

INTHEDISTRICT
COURTOFSEWARD
COUNTY,KANSAS

IN THE MATTER OF
THEESTATEOF
KAREN S.
C R O T I N G E R ,
DECEASED

Case No. SW-2025-PR-
000017
NOTICEOFHEAR-

ING
STATEOFKANSAS,
TOALLPERSONS
CONCERNED:

You are hereby notified
that a Petition has been
filed in this court by
Christopher J. Crotinger,
as surviving son and one

of the heirs of Karen S.
Crotinger, deceased, pray-
ing for the determination
of the descent of all of the
real estate described in the
Petition and all other
property owned by dece-
dent in Kansas at the time
ofdeath;andyouarehere-
by required to file your
written defenses thereto
on or before June 26,
2025, at 10:00 o'clock
a.m., of said day, in said
court, in the City of
Liberal, in Seward
County, Kansas, at which
time and place said cause
will be heard. Should you
fail therein, judgment and
decree will be entered in
due course upon said
Petition.

Christopher J. Crotinger,
Petitioner

Lane L. Frymire #24604
YOXALL, ANTRIM &
FRYMIRE, LLP
101West Fourth Street
Liberal, Kansas 67901
Phone: (620) 624-8444
Fax: (620) 624-8221
Email: lanef@yoxall-
firm.com
Attorney for Petitioner

Mobile Homes for
Rent

For Rent
Small , cute trailer
Prefer 1 -2 people
For details 620-

391-2835

Houses for Rent

127 W. Hickory
Small 1 Bedroom

house
Tenant Pays
Utilities
$550.00

Rent/Deposit
620-655-6001

Merchandise

Electronics &
Accessories

CASH PAID FOR
HIGH-END MEN’S
SPORT WATCHES
Rolex, Breitling,
omega, Patek Philipee,
Heuer, Daytona, GMT,
Submariner and
Speedmaster. These
brands only! Call for a
quote; 1-866-481-0636

Health & Beauty

VIAGRA and CIALIS
USERS! 50 Pills SPE-
CIAL $99.00 FREE
shipping! 100 percent
guaranteed. CALL
NOW! 844-887-7963

WATER DAMAGE
CLEANUP &
RESTORATION A
small amount of
water can lead to
major damage and
mold in your home. If
you have water
damage to your home,
call for a
free estimate for

complete repairs to
protect your family
and your home’s
value! Call 1-877-586-
6 6 8 8

IF YOU HAD KNEE
OR HIP REPLACE-
MENT SURGERY and
suffered an infection
between 2020 and the
present time, you may
be entitled to compen-
sation.
Call Attorney Charles
H. Johnson 1-800-535-
5 7 2 7

Kansas Press
Association and 135
more for only
$300/week. Find
employees, sell your
home or your car.
Call the Kansas
Press Association
@785-271-5304
t o d a y !

STOP OVERPAYING
FOR HEALTH
INSURANCE! A
recent study shows that
a majority of people
struggle to pay for
health coverage. Let
us show you how
much you can save.
Call Now for a no-
obligation quote: 1-

8 8 8 - 5 1 9 - 3 3 7 6

BATH & SHOWER
UPDATES in as little
as ONE DAY!!
Affordable prices -
No payments for 18
months! Lifetime
warranty & profes-
sional installs.
Senior & Military
Discounts available
Call 855-219-8849

VIAGRA and CIALIS
USERS! 50 Pills SPE-
CIAL $99.00 FREE
shipping! 100 percent
guaranteed. CALL
NOW! 844-887-79

Have A

great day!!

T U E S D A Y J U N E 1 7 , 2 0 2 5

7Classified BUY • SELL • HIRE
Find it fast!

Call 620-626-0840 • email class@liberalfirst.com


